
 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes which have been subject to major change and for which 
continuing approval is recommended 
 

Programme name Postgraduate Certificate Non-Medical Prescribing 

Education provider Buckinghamshire New University 

Mode of delivery  PT (Part time) 

Assessment ref MC04177 

Date of decision 22 May 2019 
 

Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Penny Joyce 
 Maureen Drake Sonya Lam 
 Luke Jenkinson  

 

Decision 

That the programme continues to meet the standards of education and training 
and the programme should continue to be approved. 

Reasons  

The visitors’ reports indicate that the visitors are satisfied that the programmes 
continue to meet the standards of education and training. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes which have been subject to major change and for which 
continuing approval is recommended 
 

Programme name Graduate Certificate Non-Medical Prescribing 

Education provider Buckinghamshire New University 

Mode of delivery  PT (Part time) 

Assessment ref MC04178 

Date of decision 22 May 2019 
 

Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Penny Joyce 
 Maureen Drake Sonya Lam 
 Luke Jenkinson  

 

Decision 

That the programme continues to meet the standards of education and training 
and the programme should continue to be approved. 

Reasons  

The visitors’ reports indicate that the visitors are satisfied that the programmes 
continue to meet the standards of education and training. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes which have been subject to major change and for which 
continuing approval is recommended 
 

Programme name BSc (Hons) Speech and Language Therapy 

Education provider City, University of London 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Assessment ref MC04233 

Date of decision 22 May 2019 
 

Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Penny Joyce 
 Maureen Drake Sonya Lam 
 Luke Jenkinson  

 

Decision 

That the programme continues to meet the standards of education and training 
and the programme should continue to be approved. 

Reasons  

The visitors’ reports indicate that the visitors are satisfied that the programmes 
continue to meet the standards of education and training. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes which have been subject to major change and for which 
continuing approval is recommended 
 

Programme name MSc Speech and Language Therapy 

Education provider City, University of London 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Assessment ref MC04234 

Date of decision 22 May 2019 
 

Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Penny Joyce 
 Maureen Drake Sonya Lam 
 Luke Jenkinson  

 

Decision 

That the programme continues to meet the standards of education and training 
and the programme should continue to be approved. 

Reasons  

The visitors’ reports indicate that the visitors are satisfied that the programmes 
continue to meet the standards of education and training. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes which have been subject to major change and for which 
continuing approval is recommended 
 

Programme name Master in Speech and Language Therapy (with Hons) 

Education provider City, University of London 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Assessment ref MC04264 

Date of decision 22 May 2019 
 

Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Penny Joyce 
 Maureen Drake Sonya Lam 
 Luke Jenkinson  

 

Decision 

That the programme continues to meet the standards of education and training 
and the programme should continue to be approved. 

Reasons  

The visitors’ reports indicate that the visitors are satisfied that the programmes 
continue to meet the standards of education and training. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes which have been subject to major change and for which 
continuing approval is recommended 
 

Programme name Pg Dip Speech and Language Therapy 

Education provider City, University of London 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Assessment ref MC04265 

Date of decision 22 May 2019 
 

Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Penny Joyce 
 Maureen Drake Sonya Lam 
 Luke Jenkinson  

 

Decision 

That the programme continues to meet the standards of education and training 
and the programme should continue to be approved. 

Reasons  

The visitors’ reports indicate that the visitors are satisfied that the programmes 
continue to meet the standards of education and training. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes which have been subject to major change and for which 
continuing approval is recommended 
 

Programme name BSc (Hons) Occupational Therapy 

Education provider Glasgow Caledonian University 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Assessment ref MC04228 

Date of decision 22 May 2019 
 

Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Penny Joyce 
 Maureen Drake Sonya Lam 
 Luke Jenkinson  

 

Decision 

That the programme continues to meet the standards of education and training 
and the programme should continue to be approved. 

Reasons  

The visitors’ reports indicate that the visitors are satisfied that the programmes 
continue to meet the standards of education and training. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes which have been subject to major change and for which 
continuing approval is recommended 
 

Programme name MSc Occupational Therapy (Pre-registration) 

Education provider Glasgow Caledonian University 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Assessment ref MC04235 

Date of decision 22 May 2019 
 

Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Penny Joyce 
 Maureen Drake Sonya Lam 
 Luke Jenkinson  

 

Decision 

That the programme continues to meet the standards of education and training 
and the programme should continue to be approved. 

Reasons  

The visitors’ reports indicate that the visitors are satisfied that the programmes 
continue to meet the standards of education and training. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes which have been subject to major change and for which 
continuing approval is recommended 
 

Programme name BSc (Hons) Occupational Therapy 

Education provider Glyndwr University 

Mode of delivery  PT (Part time) 

Assessment ref MC04207 

Date of decision 22 May 2019 
 

Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Penny Joyce 
 Maureen Drake Sonya Lam 
 Luke Jenkinson  

 

Decision 

That the programme continues to meet the standards of education and training 
and the programme should continue to be approved. 

Reasons  

The visitors’ reports indicate that the visitors are satisfied that the programmes 
continue to meet the standards of education and training. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes which have been subject to major change and for which 
continuing approval is recommended 
 

Programme name BSc (Hons) Occupational Therapy 

Education provider Glyndwr University 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Assessment ref MC04249 

Date of decision 22 May 2019 
 

Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Penny Joyce 
 Maureen Drake Sonya Lam 
 Luke Jenkinson  

 

Decision 

That the programme continues to meet the standards of education and training 
and the programme should continue to be approved. 

Reasons  

The visitors’ reports indicate that the visitors are satisfied that the programmes 
continue to meet the standards of education and training. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes which have been subject to major change and for which 
continuing approval is recommended 
 

Programme name BSc (Hons) Speech and Language Therapy 

Education provider Leeds Beckett University 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Assessment ref MC03750 

Date of decision 22 May 2019 
 

Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Penny Joyce 
 Maureen Drake Sonya Lam 
 Luke Jenkinson  

 

Decision 

That the programme continues to meet the standards of education and training 
and the programme should continue to be approved. 

Reasons  

The visitors’ reports indicate that the visitors are satisfied that the programmes 
continue to meet the standards of education and training. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes which have been subject to major change and for which 
continuing approval is recommended 
 

Programme name BSc (Hons) Speech and Language Therapy 

Education provider Leeds Beckett University 

Mode of delivery  PT (Part time) 

Assessment ref MC04292 

Date of decision 22 May 2019 
 

Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Penny Joyce 
 Maureen Drake Sonya Lam 
 Luke Jenkinson  

 

Decision 

That the programme continues to meet the standards of education and training 
and the programme should continue to be approved. 

Reasons  

The visitors’ reports indicate that the visitors are satisfied that the programmes 
continue to meet the standards of education and training. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes which have been subject to major change and for which 
continuing approval is recommended 
 

Programme name Master of Music Therapy (Nordoff Robbins): Music, 
Health, Society 

Education provider Nordoff Robbins (validated by Goldsmiths, University of 
London) 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Assessment ref MC04158 

Date of decision 22 May 2019 
 

Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Penny Joyce 
 Maureen Drake Sonya Lam 
 Luke Jenkinson  

 

Decision 

That the programme continues to meet the standards of education and training 
and the programme should continue to be approved. 

Reasons  

The visitors’ reports indicate that the visitors are satisfied that the programmes 
continue to meet the standards of education and training. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes which have been subject to major change and for which 
continuing approval is recommended 
 

Programme name BA (Hons) Social Work 

Education provider University of Plymouth 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Assessment ref MC03721 

Date of decision 22 May 2019 
 

Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Penny Joyce 
 Maureen Drake Sonya Lam 
 Luke Jenkinson  

 

Decision 

That the programme continues to meet the standards of education and training 
and the programme should continue to be approved. 

Reasons  

The visitors’ reports indicate that the visitors are satisfied that the programmes 
continue to meet the standards of education and training. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes which have been subject to major change and for which 
continuing approval is recommended 
 

Programme name BA (Hons) Social Work 

Education provider University of Plymouth 

Mode of delivery  WBL (Work based learning) 

Assessment ref MC04191 

Date of decision 22 May 2019 
 

Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Penny Joyce 
 Maureen Drake Sonya Lam 
 Luke Jenkinson  

 

Decision 

That the programme continues to meet the standards of education and training 
and the programme should continue to be approved. 

Reasons  

The visitors’ reports indicate that the visitors are satisfied that the programmes 
continue to meet the standards of education and training. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes which have been subject to major change and for which 
continuing approval is recommended 
 

Programme name Diploma Higher Education Paramedic Science for 
Emergency Medical Technicians 

Education provider Swansea University 

Mode of delivery  PT (Part time) 

Assessment ref MC04189 

Date of decision 22 May 2019 
 

Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Penny Joyce 
 Maureen Drake Sonya Lam 
 Luke Jenkinson  

 

Decision 

That the programme continues to meet the standards of education and training 
and the programme should continue to be approved. 

Reasons  

The visitors’ reports indicate that the visitors are satisfied that the programmes 
continue to meet the standards of education and training. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes which have been subject to major change and for which 
continuing approval is recommended 
 

Programme name BSc (Hons) Occupational Therapy 

Education provider Teesside University 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Assessment ref MC04196 

Date of decision 22 May 2019 
 

Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Penny Joyce 
 Maureen Drake Sonya Lam 
 Luke Jenkinson  

 

Decision 

That the programme continues to meet the standards of education and training 
and the programme should continue to be approved. 

Reasons  

The visitors’ reports indicate that the visitors are satisfied that the programmes 
continue to meet the standards of education and training. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair 



 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes which have been subject to major change and for which 
continuing approval is recommended 
 

Programme name BSc (Hons) Diagnostic Radiography 

Education provider University of Derby 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Assessment ref MC04194 

Date of decision 22 May 2019 
 

Panel: Sonya Lam (Chair) Penny Joyce 
 Maureen Drake Luke Jenkinson 
   

 

Decision 

That the programme continues to meet the standards of education and training 
and the programme should continue to be approved. 

Reasons  

The visitors’ reports indicate that the visitors are satisfied that the programmes 
continue to meet the standards of education and training. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Sonya Lam, Panel Chair 



 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes which have been subject to major change and for which 
continuing approval is recommended 
 

Programme name BSc (Hons) Diagnostic Radiography and Medical Imaging 

Education provider University of Portsmouth 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Assessment ref MC04117 

Date of decision 22 May 2019 
 

Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Sonya Lam 
 Maureen Drake Luke Jenkinson 
   

 

Decision 

That the programme continues to meet the standards of education and training 
and the programme should continue to be approved. 

Reasons  

The visitors’ reports indicate that the visitors are satisfied that the programmes 
continue to meet the standards of education and training. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair



 

 
 

 
 
 
 
Education and Training Committee Panel 
 
Programmes which have been subject to major change and for which 
continuing approval is recommended 
 

Programme name BSc (Hons) Operating Department Practice 

Education provider University of Portsmouth 

Mode of delivery  FT (Full time) 

Assessment ref MC04121 

Date of decision 22 May 2019 
 

Panel: Stephen Wordsworth (Chair) Sonya Lam 
 Maureen Drake Luke Jenkinson 
   

 

Decision 

That the programme continues to meet the standards of education and training 
and the programme should continue to be approved. 

Reasons  

The visitors’ reports indicate that the visitors are satisfied that the programmes 
continue to meet the standards of education and training. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Signed: Stephen Wordsworth, Panel Chair 
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